
 

 

SC351 How To 

Prepare for use 

1 

 
Unplug battery    
charger. 
 

2 

 
Wrap cord accordingly. 

3 
 

Inspect squeegee, 
brushes or pads then 
install. 
 

4 
 

Fill machine with 
appropriate solution 
(temperature should not exceed 
130°F). 

5 
 

Inspect ball float cage. 

6 
 

Lower recovery tank lid. 

7 

 
Get familiar with the 
control panel. 
 

8 

 
Enable push-button and 
lever to engage 
brush/pad holder then 
release. 

9 
 

Turn machine on. 
 

10 
 

Choose program for the 
type of work to be 
performed. 
 

11 
 

Press the solution flow 
control switch. 

12 
 

Begin scrubbing. 



 

 

SC351 How To 

Store the Machine 

1 

 
Empty recovery tank 
and solution tank.  

2 

 
Rinse and wash 
recovery tank with 
clean water.  

3 
 

Inspect and wash, 
vacuum grid and 
automatic shut-off float. 

4 

 
Take squeegee off and 
remove debris. 

5 
 

Inspect squeegee, rinse 
and replace if needed. 

6 
 

Remove, clean and 
inspect brush or pad. 
Rinse with warm water. 
Hang to dry. Replace if 
needed. 

7 

 
Charge batteries. 

8 

 
Wipe exterior of 
machine with a damp 
cloth. 

9 

 
Lift recover tank lid to 
allow inside of the tank 
to dry. 
 

 

 

 

 

 



 

 

SC351 How To 

Daily, Weekly and Occasional Maintenance 

1 

 
Clean brush daily. 
 

2 
 

Clean squeegee daily 
by removing debris. 
 

3 
Check each battery 
cell’s water level (does 
not apply to gel 
batteries). Charge 
batteries daily. 

4 

 
Clean tank and vacuum 
grid daily. 

5 

 
Perform squeegee 
blade check and/or 
replacement weekly. 

6 

 
 
 
 
Screw and nut 
tightening check. 
Perform this task after 
the first 8 hours of 
operation. 

7 

 
Brush deck rubber pad 
check and/or 
replacement 

8 
 

Brush deck end-of-
stroke cable check 
and/or replacement 
yearly. 
 

9  
Brush deck rubber 
flange check and/or 
replacement yearly. 

 

Every 6 Months 


